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TheClassics.us. Paperback. Book Condition: New. This item is
printed on demand. Paperback. 20 pages. Dimensions: 9.7in. x
7.4in. x 0.0in.This historic book may have numerous typos and
missing text. Purchasers can usually download a free scanned
copy of the original book (without typos) from the publisher.
Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1916 edition. Excerpt: . . . attend.
The subject matter of such conventions is brought to those not
present by means of the fraternity publication. The badge of
Alpha Kappa Psi is a disk resembling an antique coin,
displaying on its face a Roman galley with the Greek letters on
the sail. The Fraternity colors are blue and gold, and the
flower, the chrysanthemum. The total enrollment of Alpha
Kappa Psi is now nearing the one thousand mark. Local
Chapters Government. Local chapters elect their own officers
and manage their own affairs, with the exception of the
administrative portion which comes under the jurisdiction of
the General Fraternity. The New York Chapter during the
college year 1908-1909, first offered the Alpha Kappa Psi
Fraternity prize to students of the School of Commerce,
Accounts and Finance. Other chapters have taken up this idea
in various forms. Nu Chapter announced last year,...
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